REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA CARLETON MEMORANDUM

MUNICIPALITE REGIONALE D'OTTAWA CARLETON NOTE DE SERVICE
Our File/N/Réf. 03 06-97-0017

Your File/V/Réf.

DATE 31 October 1997

TO/DEST. The Chair and Members of Council

FROM/EXP. Regional Clerk

SUBJECT/OBJET RECORD OF TENDER OPENINGS
FOR THE MONTH OF OCTOBER 1997
(AS PERCORPORATE POLICY MANUALSECTION 4.6.6)

BACKGROUND

In accordance with Section 4. 6. 6, Opening of Tenders, of the Corporate Policy Manual,
“all tenders shall be received by the Clerk and shall be opened in public by the Clerk at the time
specified in the tender documents.”

Tender documents are officially opened by the Regional Clerk’s designate on every Tuesday of
the month after 3:00 p.m. On occasion, such as during the idle construction season, tenders may
not be called and tender openings are not conducted.

Attached for your information are the Records of Tender Openings for October 07 and 21, 1997.
It is our intention to directly provide all Councillors with the Record of Tender Openings on a
regular basis, so that Councillors may be informed of Regional activities.

Approved by
Mary Jo Woollam
Regional Clerk

Irp
Attach (2)

c.c. Directors/Managers of Administration and/or Finance

INFORMATION PREVIOUSLY DISTRIBUTED
TO BE LISTED ON CORPORATE

SERVICES AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
COMMITTEE AGENDA - 26 January 98




Clerk’s File No.: 06-97-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 07 OCTOBER 1997

D. Whelan, Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
D. Goodwin, Finance Department

B. Mooney, Finance Department

C. Crowder, Clerk’s Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division for evaluation and recommendation.

1. NINE CHEVROLET LUMINA FOUR DOOR SEDAN POLICE AUTOMOBILES
CONTRACT NO.: 0070-60-EEO-T2/97

Option 1 Option 2
Detail Leasing $ No Bid No Bid
Olympic Pontiac Buick Inc. No Bid No Bid
Turpin Pontiac Buick No Bid No Bid
ATI Canada No Bid 287,052.03
Belisle Automobiles 69 Ltd. 271,221.75 No Bid

2. RECYCLING SERVICES AT TRAIL ROAD LANDFILL SITE,
CONTRACT NO.: 0962-70-p1/97

Cohen & Cohen $ *
Ed’'s Salvage *
Glenview Iron & Metal Ltd. *
Myral *

Osgoode Recycling Centre



SNOW REMOVAL - WASTE WATER COLLECTION BRANCH
CONTRACT NO.: 0988-65-T1/97

BCS Building Cleaning Services $ 66,990.00
James P. Quinn 79,000.00
Marcel Brazeau Ltd. 82,700.00
Goldie Mohr Ltd. 88,435.03
Elm 2000 Inc. 91,233.67
Von Wurden 98,325.00
M & T Finishing 111,140.00
Landraulics Ltd. 139,750.00
PropCom Management 144,605.00
ABC Equipment 197,350.00

Approved by D. Whelan
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-97-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 21 OCTOBER 1997

R. Nelson, Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
L. Capello, Environment & Transportation Department

G. Covillo, Environment & Transportation Department

D. Cullen, Environment & Transportation Department

P. Delahunty, Environment & Transportation Department
J. Eccles, Environment & Transportation Department

A. Gil, Environment & Transportation Department

D. Robertson, Environment & Transportation Department
B. Mooney, Finance Department

D. Goodwin, Finance Department

C. Crowder, Clerk’s Department

The tenders were taken by the Environment & Transportation Department for evaluation and
recommendation.

1. PLAZA BRIDGE REHABILITATION
CONTRACT NO.: 97-517

Doran Contractors $ 17,568,372.00
Dufferin Construction 18,018,844.75
Thomas G. Fuller & Sons 18,973,701.00
Walter & Sci Construction Canada Ltd. 20,210,363.00

Approved by R. Nelson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



