REGION OF OTTAWA CARLETON MEMORANDUM

REGION D'OTTAWA CARLETON NOTE DE SERVICE
Our File/N/Réf. 03 06-99-0017

Your File/V/Réf.

DATE 03 August 1999

TO/DEST. The Chair and Members of Council

FROM/EXP. Regional Clerk

SUBJECT/OBJET RECORD OF TENDER OPENINGS
FOR THE MONTHS OF JUNE AND JULY 1999
(AS PERCORPORATE POLICY MANUALSECTION 4.6.6)

BACKGROUND

In accordance with the provisions for the Opening of Tenders in Section 4.6.6 of the
Corporate Policy Manual, “all tenders shall be received by the Clerk and shall be opened in
public by the Clerk at the time specified in the tender documents.”

Tender documents are officially opened by the Regional Clerk’s designate after 3:00 p.m.
on the day specified in the tender documents. On occasion, such as during the idle
construction season, tenders may not be called and tender openings are not conducted.

Attached for your information are the Records of Tender Openings for the following
dates: 03, 04, 08, 15, 18, 22, 24, 29, and 30 June 1999, and 03, 08, 09, 12, 13, 15, 20,
22, 26, 27 and 29 July 1999. It is our intention to provide all Members of Council with
the Record of Tender Openings on a regular basis so that you may be informed of
Regional activities.

Approved by
Mary Jo Woollam

c.c. Directors/Managers of Administration and/or Finance

INFORMATION PREVIOUSLY DISTRIBUTED
TO BE LISTED ON CORPORATE

SERVICES AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
COMMITTEE AGENDA - 07 Sep 99




Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 03 June 1999

Shane Kennedy, Manager, Administrative Services, Clerk’'s Department
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
J. Valenzuela, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

SUPPLY OF ONE 200" WHEELBASE, CAB & CHASSIS W/20 FOOT

ALUMINUM BOX
TENDER NO.: 99003

Surgenor Truck Centre 94,167.75
Ottawa Truck Centre 101,534.65

REMOVE, REBUILD AND REPLACEMENT OF ENGINES ON O-C

TRANSPO BUSES
TENDER NO.: 99-39922

$
Harper Detroit Diesel-Allison A: 1. 29,856.88 B:1.29,854.58
2. 26,856.88 2.29,854.58
3. 26,856.88 3. 29,854.58
4.29,856.88 4.29,854.58
Cummins Ontario Inc. A: 132,660.00 B:1. 32,660.00
2. no bid 2. no bid
3. no bid 3. no bid
4. no bid 4. no bid
SN Diesel A: 1. 35,346.16 B: no bids
2.21,712.00
3.21,108.09
4. 20,302.86

Approved by S. Kennedy
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 04 June 1999

Daphne Abela, Coordinator, Administrative Services, Clerk’'s Department
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

GRIT TANK - R.O.P.E.C.
TENDER NO.: R-9999-03000-T4/99

$
J.P. Sulpher Construction Ltd. 284,624.00
Underground Services (1983) Ltd. 290,640.00
Thomas G. Fuller & Sons 378,150.00
TESC Contracting Company Ltd. 422,435.00

Approved by DAbela
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 08 June 1999

Cheryle Watson, Corporate Services and Economic Development Committee
Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
J. Valenzuela, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
P. Kerridge, Environment and Transportation Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

TRANSITWAY STNS. REHAB. - BLAIR STN., WESTBORO STN.
TENDER NO.: 99-603

$
Digio Robinson Inc. 464,770.00
Meyknecht-Lischer Cont. Ltd. 542,938.00
Thomas G. Fuller & Sons 621,100.00

Approved by C. Watson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 15 JUNE 1999

J.B. O’Gorman, Deputy Clerk
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

FINDLAY CREEK BRIDGE - REHAB.
TENDER NO.: ETL99-7004

$
Dufferin Construction Company 86,056.00
Louis W. Bray Construction Ltd. 95,719.00
Thomas G. Fuller & Sons Ltd. 103,358.00
Meyknecht-Lischer Contractors Ltd. 103,775.00
LaurentLeblanc Limited 116,371.20

VACUUM COMBINATION TRUCK SERVICES
TENDER NO.: 01499-96892-T01

$
Sewer Matic A: 63,000.00
B: 63,000.00
Badger Daylighting Incorporated A:110,000.00
B: 110,000.00

Approved by J.B. O’'Gorman
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 18 JUNE 1999

Rosemary Nelson, Transportation Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

G. Adams, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
S. Harish, Environment & Transportation Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation

and recommendation.

WATERMAIN REHAB. KIRKWOOD AVENUE
TENDER NO.: 99-301

$
K.C.E. Construction Ltd. 730,250.50
Ottawa Greenbelt Const. Co. Ltd. 837,324.00
Pedro Construction Limited 898,017.00
Dufferin Construction Company 941,775.00
C.A.C.E. Construction (1991) Ltd. 958,409.00
Graydex Ottawa Inc. 991,911.91

Approved by R. Nelson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 22 JUNE 1999

Cheryle Watson, Corporate Services and Economic Development Committee

Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
G. Adams, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

PETER D. CLARK LONG TERM CARE CENTRE
TENDER NO.: R-01099-90923-T01

$
Nicolini Construction & Engineering Ltd. 15,992,800.00
Taplen Construction Ltd. 16,968,000.00
Ruiter Construction Ltd. 16,968,700.00
Westeinde Construction Ltd. 17,437,000.00
Bondfield Construction Company Limited 18,100,000.00

Approved by C. Watson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 24 JUNE 1999

Shane Kennedy, Manager, Administrative Services, Clerk’'s Department
(received and opened tenders)

R. Nelson, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

COMPOST SCREENING - TRAIL ROAD LANDFILL SITE
TENDER NO.: 00999-98859-T1

$
Lapointe Drainage Limited 28,200.00
R.W. Tomlinson Limited 37,080.00
International Recycling Consultants 42,240.00
George W. Drmmmond Limited 44,400.00

STORAGE TANK & VALVE CHAMBER

TENDER NO.: R-00999-93691-T01

$
C.A.C.E. Construction 198,868.00
K.C.E. Construction 206,268.00
W.B. Maloney Construction 213,120.00
Graydex Ottawa Inc. 240,911.00
Louis W. Bray Construction Ltd. 254,379.00
Dufferin Construction Company 283,957.00
Meyknecht-Lischer Contractors Ltd. 285,300.00

TESC Contracting Limited 322,398.73



3.

ROOF REPLACEMENT - 899 BELFAST ROAD
TENDER NO.: 99-107

$

ScottHealey Roofing Ltd. 214,000.00
Simluc Contractors Ltd. 217,421.00
Ron Robinson Roofing Ltd. 218,868.00
TP Crawford Limited 229,903.00
Covertite Eastern Ltd. 231,500.00
Ray Cyr Roofing 232,670.00
D.R. Devine Roofing & Sheet Metal 254,000.00

Approved by S. Kennedy
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 29 JUNE 1999

S. Kennedy, Manager, Administrative Services, Clerk’s Department
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department

J. Valenzuela, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
W. Gryz, Environment & Transportation Department

B. Wadden, Environment & Transportation Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

REHABILITATION - LEMIEUX ISLAND
TENDER NO.: 99-306

$
Underground Services (1983) Ltd. 541,678.00
Advanced Const. Tech. Ltd. 572,000.00
TESC Contracting Company Ltd. 632,989.00
DRL Restoration Limited 719,900.00
J.C. Sulpher Construction Ltd. 901,641.00

SOUTHEAST TRANSITWAY - HURDMAN STN.
TENDER NO.: 99-600

$
LaurentLeblanc Limited 179,330.00
Meyknecht-Lischer Contractors 192,260.00
Toras Const. Ltd. 220,720.00

Canada Paving and Construction Limited 273,310.00



3.

REHABILITATION - REPLACE. STRUCTURES

TENDER NO.: ETL99-7000
$
Goldie Mohr Ltd.
Karson Kartage & Konstruction (1994)
Limited
Louis W. Bray
Geo W. Drummond Ltd.

MISC. WATERWORKS MATERIALS
TENDER NO.: R-00599-83073-T01

Emco Supply

Ontario Water Products (Eastern) Ltd.

Westburne Canada Valve

153,004.88

167,667.00

186,116.00

193,215.00
B: 7837.25 1. 22,009.04
K:117,093.00 N: 162,185.42
R: N/Q V: 3,300.55

B: 76,318.74 I: 22,653.16

K: 108,840.60 N: 255,740.22
R: 18,293.68 V: 3,311.69
B: 486.02 I 22,176.16
K: 108,675.00 N: 160,119.76
R: 19,421.42 V: 3,372.62

Approved by S. Kennedy
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 30 JUNE 1999

Daphne Abela, Coordinator, Administrative Services, Clerk’'s Department
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
J. Valenzuela, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation

and recommendation.

CATCH BASIN SUMP CLEANING
TENDER NO.: R-01499-96873-T02

$
Sewer Matic 110,564.85
SUPPLY OF INDUSTRIAL TOWELS
TENDER NO.: C/R-01399-73510-T01

$
Snelling Paper Limited 33,614.50
Unisource Canada Inc. 33,614.50
Swish Maintenance Limited 34,012.50
Arch Industries 36,504.00
Hansler-Smith Limited 37,704.00
Legere Industrial Supplies 83,839.60

Approved by D Abela
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 03 July 1999

Dawn Whelan, Planning and Environment Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

WINDOW WASHING
TENDER NO.: R-01499-91081-T02

$
Cody Window Cleaning 28,605.00
Soulard Window Cleaning Services 31,980.00
City Wide Window Cleaners 34,650.00
Proserv Window Cleaning Services 35,086.00

Approved by D. Whelan
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 08 July 1999

Shane Kennedy, Manager, Administrative Services, Clerk’'s Department
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

AUTOMOTIVE HOIST
TENDER NO.: R-00199-07544-T01

Crown Maintenance Inc. 32,976.00

RENOVATIONS - OTTAWA-CARLETON REGIONAL POLICE FACILITY,
245 GREENBANK ROAD
TENDER NO.: R-00999-90922-T02

$
Frecon Construction Limited 158,000.00
Garvey Construction Limited 184,400.00
BellevueConst. Ltd. 191,000.00
J.C. Sulpher Construction Ltd. 199,817.00
Mueller-Hein Corporation 233,000.00

BUILDING ADDITION - LINDENLEA COMMUNITY CENTRE
TENDER NO.: R-00999-90922-T04

$
Zimola Construction 111,250.00
Michanie Construction Inc. 112,500.00
Waterdon Construction Ltd. 112,715.00
Frecon Construction Limited 122,000.00
Pranger-Debruyn Construction Ltd. 130,000.00
Garvey Construction Limited 140,190.00

Approved by S. Kennedy
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 09 July 1999

Rosemary Nelson, Transportation Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

MODIFICATIONS - CLYDE AVENUE GARAGE
TENDER NO.: R-00999-90922-T02

$
Waterdon Construction Ltd. 232,600.00
Frecon Construction Ltd. 233,000.00
Rahm Construction Ltd. 233,240.00
Zimola Construction Ltd. 258,000.00
McDonald Brothers Construction Inc. 282,000.00
Taplen Construction Ltd. 293,200.00

Approved by R. Nelson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 12 July 1999

Daphne Abela, Coordinator, Administrative Services, Clerk’'s Department
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

DISPOSAL - POLICE MOTORCYCLES
TENDER NO.: R-00999-07012-Q01

$
Bill Ranger (1) 777.00 (2) 2222.00
Brian Kilby Q) o (2) 7800.00
Brunette Auto Parts (1) 4178.00 (2) 6234.00
C. Villeneuve o (2) 6888.00
Garage Luc Gosdin (1) 2599.00 (2) 2599.00
H.P.1. (1) 2800.00 (2) 3000.00
Hebert (1) 3000.00 (2) 2700.00
HowardSchafer (1) o (2) 5101.00
Paul Buchanan o (2) 9000.00
Stentar (1) o (2) 5100.00

Approved by D Abela
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 13 July 1999

Monigue Beauregard, Community Services Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
R. Crete, Environment and Transportation Department

N. Kirewskie, Environment and Transportation Department

P. Kerridge, Environment and Transportation Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

WEST TRANSITWAY - STAGE 1A, ACRES ROAD
TENDER NO.: 98-603

$
Dibblee Paving & Materials 1,166,791.77
Tarcon Ltd. 1,230,404.00
Karson Kartage & Konstruction (1994) 1,265,911.40

Limited

RESTORATION OF ROADSIDE DITCHES
TENDER NO.: 99-811

$
Graydex Ottawa Inc. 133,060.00
Von Wurden & Assoc. Inc. 183,580.00

ASPHALTIC OVERLAY ON HUNT CLUB RD.
TENDER NO.: 99-813

$
Dibblee Paving & Materials Ltd. 491,010.34
Beaver Road Builders Ltd. 561,063.40
Cornwall Gravel Company Limited 644,959.00



4. CULVERT REHABILITATION - STRUCTURES 9721,9809, AND 9850
TENDER NO.: ETL99-7003

$
Meyknecht-Lischer 145,637.00
Goldie Mohr Ltd. 179,689.40
Martin & Martin 188,652.00
Eric’s Concrete & Masonry Services Ltd. 194,715.00
Louis W. Bray 250,580.00

Approved by M. Beauregard
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 15 July 1999

Wendy Fedec, Manager, Council & Committee Services, Clerk’s Department
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

REFINISHING OF STRUCTURAL STEEL
TENDER NO.: 99-142

$
Hanco Inc. 269,400.00

ONE, TWO WHEEL DRIVE P/U W/8' BOX
TENDER NO.: 99-269

$
Belisle Chevrolet Geo Oldsmobile Cadillac  23,586.50

ONE 1999 ELECTRIC REACH TRUCK
TENDER NO.: 99-270

$
Liftow Limited 32,027.50
Johnston Equipment 37,009.30
Powlift Cat 39,400.15

ONE SELF-PROPELLED INDUSTRIAL POWER SWEEPER
TENDER NO.: 99325

$
Swish Maintenance Limited 44,116.30
Tennant Company 60,245.53

Approved by W. Fedec
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 20 July 1999

J.B. O’Gorman, Deputy Clerk
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
F. Marcuccio, Environment and Transportation Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

SURFACE TREATMENT & SLURRY SEAL/MARCH RD.
TENDER NO.: 99-815

$
Smiths Construction 253,121.00

QUEEN ELIZABETH DR. & TORRINGTON PLACE
TENDER NO.: ETL99-3010

$
C.A.C.E. Construction (1991) Ltd. 287,376.00
Ottawa Greenbelt Const. Co. Ltd. 289,097.00
Dufferin Construction Company 320,607.00
Pedro Construction Limited 334,834.00
Graydex Ottawa Inc. 368,911.00
1186993 Ontario Inc. 369,046.00
K.C.E. Construction Ltd. 381,969.00

Approved by J.B. O’'Gorman
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 22 July 1999

Dawn Whelan, Planning and Environment Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

1. MANUFACTURING OF QUARTER CENTURY RINGS (Employee Services)
TENDER NO.: 99255

HENRY BIRKS & SONS

RING WITH COLOUR STONE PLAIN BAND
Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring

Base ring price $ 180.00 $ 200.00 $ 240.00 $ 300.00
diamond $34.00 $34.00 $ 40.00 $ 40.00
die cost 0 0 0 0
produce prototype 0 0 0 0
base price of gold/market price  $ 415.00 $ 415.00 $ 415.00 $ 415.00
engraving cost per ring 0 0 0 0
velvet box 0 0 0 0
delivery lead time from approval4 weeks 4 weeks 4 weeks 4 weeks

of prototype

DESIGN RENOIR

RING WITH COLOUR STONE PLAIN BAND
Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring

Base ring price $ 141.00 $ 144.00 $ 166.00 $ 166.00
diamond $102.00 $104.00 $114.00 $114.00
die cost 0 0 0 0
produce prototype 0 0 0 0
base price of gold/market price  $254.75U.S. $254.75U.S. $254.75U.S. $254.751
engraving cost per ring/letter 0 0 0 0
velvet box $ 1.00/ring $ 1.00/ring $ 1.00/ring $ 1.00/ring
delivery lead time from approvald to 6 weeks 4 to 6 weeks 4 to 6 weeks 4 to 6 weeks

of prototype



CAPITAL MARKETING

RING WITH COLOUR STONE PLAIN BAND
Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring

Base ring price $ 250.00 $ 300.00 $ 300.00 $ 255.00
diamond included included included included
die cost included included included included
produce prototype $ 250.00 $ 300.00 $ 300.00 $ 255.00
base price of gold/market price  included included included included
engraving cost per ring/letter $ 1.00/letter $ 1.00/letter $ 1.00/letter $ 1.00/lettel
velvet box $2.85 $2.85 $2.85 $2.85
delivery lead time from approval3 weeks 3 weeks 3 weeks 3 weeks

of prototype

RONDEAU SMITHSON & ASSOCIATES

RING WITH COLOUR STONE PLAIN BAND
Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring Ladies Ring Men'’s Ring

Base ring price $164.71 $174.15 $194.15 $ 200.00
diamond $2.95 $52.95 $39.70 $ 66.20
die cost $ 275.00 $ 275.00 $ 250.00 $ 250.00
produce prototype 3 wks. - cost of3 wks. - cost of 3 wks. - same 3 wks. - same

die + base ring die + base ring costs as above costs as above

+ 2 stones = + 2 diamonds = for die, base for die, base

$545.61 $555.05 ring & diamond ring & diamon
base price of gold/market price  $ 375.00 $ 375.00 $ 375.00 $ 375.00
engraving cost per ring/letter $ .15/letter $ .15/letter $ .15/letter $.15/letter
velvet box $3.35 $3.35 $3.35 $3.35

delivery lead time from approvalapprox. 4 wks  approx. 4 wks  approx. 4 wks  approx. 4 wks
of prototype

Approved by D. Whelan
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 26 July 1999

Monigue Beauregard, Community Services Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

BUS GARAGE FLOOR SLAB REPAIRS
TENDER NO.: 99-324

$
Alti Construction 213,000.00
Bellai Brothers (Ontario) Ltd. 310,925.00

Approved by M. Beauregard
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 27 July 1999

Cheryle Watson, Corporate Services and Economic Development Committee
Coordinator

(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
R. Crete, Environment and Transportation Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

WEST HUNT CLUB ROAD - REALIGNMENT AT MOODIE DRIVE
TENDER NO.: 99-505

$
Tarcon Ltd. 681,142.45
Dibblee Paving & Materials Limited 749,409.95
Karson Kartage & Konstruction (1994) 787,000.00

Limited

ASPHALTIC OVERLAY ON ALBERT ST.
TENDER NO.: 99-814

$
Dibblee Paving & Materials Limited 916,853.15
Beaver Road Builders Ltd. 976,792.00

ASPHALTIC OVERLAY ON OLD HWY 17
TENDER NO.: 99-816

$
Beaver Road Builders Ltd. 1,396,785.00

Dibblee Paving & Materials Limited 1,411,357.78

Approved by C. Watson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



1.

Clerk’s File No.: 06-99-0017

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 29 July 1999

Monigue Beauregard, Community Services Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

T. Borrello, Clerk’s Department
K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation
and recommendation.

HOT-IN-PLACE RECYCLING ON RIVER ROAD
TENDER NO.: 99-817

$
Astro Asphalt Recycling Ltd. 1,112,085.70
Beaver Road Builders 1,198,414.50
Dibblee Paving & Materials Limited 1,389,149.24
NURSERY STOCK TREES
TENDER NO.: C/R-01399-59575-T03
$
Brookdale Treeland Nurseries read names only

Dutchmaster Nurseries Limited
Pepiniere Cramer Inc.
Sheridan Nurseries

Uxbridge Nurseries Limited

V. Kraus Nurseries Ltd.

Approved by M. Beauregard
on behalf of the Regional Clerk



