

Our File/N/Réf. **03** 06-98-0017
Your File/V/Réf.

DATE 03 December 1998

TO/DEST. The Chair and Members of Council

FROM/EXP. Regional Clerk

SUBJECT/OBJET RECORD OF TENDER OPENINGS
FOR THE MONTH OF NOVEMBER 1998
(AS PER *CORPORATE POLICY MANUAL* SECTION 4.6.6)

BACKGROUND

In accordance with the provisions for the Opening of Tenders in Section 4.6.6 of the Corporate Policy Manual, “all tenders shall be received by the Clerk and shall be opened in public by the Clerk at the time specified in the tender documents.”

Tender documents are officially opened by the Regional Clerk’s designate after 3:00 p.m. on the day specified in the tender documents. On occasion, such as during the idle construction season, tenders may not be called and tender openings are not conducted.

Attached for your information are the Records of Tender Openings for 03, 12, 13, 16, 17, 23, 24, 26 and 27 of November 1998. It is our intention to provide all Members of Council with the Record of Tender Openings on a regular basis so that you may be informed of Regional activities.

Approved by
Mary Jo Woollam

c.c. Directors/Managers of Administration and/or Finance

INFORMATION PREVIOUSLY DISTRIBUTED
TO BE LISTED ON CORPORATE
SERVICES AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT
COMMITTEE AGENDA - 05 Jan 99

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 03 November 1998

M. Beauregard, Community Services Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
T. Borrello, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. SNOW REMOVAL - RMOC PROPERTIES
CONTRACT NO.: R-0988-65-T5/98

	A	B
	\$	
Burns Landscape Maintenance	50,300.00	6,650.00
BCS Property Services	87,280.00	29,060.00
Primrose Cartage Ltd.	87,800.00	7,980.00

2. SUPPLY OF WATER SOLUBLE POLYELECTROLYTES
CONTRACT NO.: R-0885-70-T1/98

	A	B
	\$	
Canada Flocculants Inc.	568,192.80	No quote
Allied Colloids	781,830.00	No quote
Degremont Epac Canada Inc.	1,201,470.00	No quote
Jes - Chem Ltd.	1,309,079.80	No quote

Approved by M. Beauregard
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 12 November 1998

S. Kennedy, Manager, Clerk's Department
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
D. Abela, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. SUPPLY, DELIVERY & MAINTENANCE OF SUN HARDWARE,
SOFTWARE PERIPHERALS
CONTRACT NO.: R-0205-14SUN-T2/98

DigiDyne	Various prices
GE Capital Information Technology Solutions	Various prices
Sun Microsystems of Canada Inc.	Various prices

2. TRAINING SERVICES - OFFICE AUTOMATION
CONTRACT NO.: R-0952-90-P1/99

Read names only

CDI Corporate Education Services
ctc Computer Training
Delcom / MultiHexa
Educom Training Systems Inc.
Executrain
Griffin Computer Training & Consult
Nexus Training
Productivity Point International

Approved by S. Kennedy
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 13 November 1998

M. Beauregard, Community Services Committee Coordinator
(received tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
S. Kennedy, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. SUPPLY OF RUGGED MOBILE LAPTOPS
CONTRACT NO.: R-0205-11-NBO-P1/98

Received tenders only

Clearnet
Cycomm Mobile Solutions
Dafotel Inc.
Forward Thinking
Nova Networks
Panasonic
Stealth Computer Corporation

Approved by M. Beauregard
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 16 November 1998

W. Fedec, Executive Director, Police Services Board
(received tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
S. Kennedy, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. RFP - DEVELOPMENT OF PEDESTRIAN LINKAGES
CONTRACT NO.: R-0906-65-P1/98

Received proposals only

Chen et al
Katz Webster Clancey
LURA Consulting Group
PFS Ltd.
Strategic Property Development Services
Taylor Philips Architects

Approved by W. Fedec
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 17 November 1998

R. Nelson, Transportation Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
D. Abela, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. COMPLETION OF DEMOLITION RMOC DWELLINGS ST. JOSEPH BLVD
CONTRACT NO.: R-9999-02050-T2/98

	\$	
Bradley Kelly Const. Ltd.		29,532.00
Primrose Cartage Ltd.		31,198.00
Demolition Outaouais (1992 Enr.)		33,000.00
Michanie Construction Inc.		33,055.00
Dion Demolition & Tree Inc.		38,400.00
Beaver Road Bldrs Ltd.		39,140.00
Dufresne Piling Company (1967) Ltd.		39,330.00
118993 Ontario Inc.		41,876.00

Approved by R. Nelson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 23 November 1998

C. Watson, Corporate Services and Economic Development
Committee Coordinator
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
S. Kennedy, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. WEATHER CARPETS 111 LISGAR ST.
CONTRACT NO.: R-0360-40-Q1/99

\$
Per month

Ability Janitorial Services Limited	975.00
Whistle Kleen Enterprises	1,171.82
Tidy Klean	2,398.00
Black Sea Star Inc.	3,256.46

2. COMPLETION OF UPGRADE (EMCS)
CONTRACT NO.: R-9999-16930-T1/98

\$

ACS Ottawa Inc.	147,950.00
ACS Montreal Inc.	148,500.00
H & E Comfort Controls	149,500.00

3. RFP-BUSINESS DIRECTIONS DOCUMENTS
CONTRACT NO.: R-0924-15-P1/98

Read names only

CMS Group Inc.
DBS International
Deloitte & Touche
Human Potential Consultants Inc.
KPMG
Maxgroup Associates
Navator
Partnaires Delta Partners
Price Waterhouse Coopers
Secor

Approved by C. Watson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 24 November 1998

J.B. O'Gorman, Deputy Clerk
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
T. Borrello, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. LIQUID SODIUM SILCATE
CONTRACT NO.: R-0180-84-T1/98

	\$	
Stanchem		126,820.63
Quadra Chemicals Ltd.		131,341.16

Approved by J.B. O'Gorman
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 26 November 1998

S. Kennedy, Manager, Clerk's Department
(received and opened tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. SUPPLY, DELIVERY & MAINTENANCE OF BACK UP STORAGE
HARDWARE AND SOFTWARE
CONTRACT NO.: R-0205-31-T1/98

	A	B
	\$	
Unylogix Technologies Inc.	No bid	82,951.75
Open Storage Solutions	No bid	92,230.00
Nova Networks	No bid	95,248.75
Sun Microsystems Computers	99,391.28	No bid
Pyramid Solutions Inc.	120,851.86	100,162.70
GE Capital Technology Management Services Inc.	116,078.04	100,558.30
Patriot	No bid	101,297.75
DigiDyne Inc.	111,804.73	104,586.71

Approved by S..Kennedy
on behalf of the Regional Clerk

THE REGIONAL MUNICIPALITY OF OTTAWA-CARLETON

RECORD OF TENDER OPENING

3:15 P.M. 27 November 1998

R. Nelson, Transportation Committee Coordinator
(received tenders)

K. Richenhaller, Finance Department, Supply Management Division
S. Kennedy, Clerk's Department

The tenders were taken by the Supply Management Division staff for evaluation and recommendation.

1. SUPPLY OF GENERATORS
CONTRACT NO.: R-0285-39-T1/98

Names read only

Aries International
Cummins Ontario Inc.
Gal Power Systems (1992) Ltd.
Genrep Ltd./Ltée
Midwest Power Products

Approved by R. Nelson
on behalf of the Regional Clerk